
MS Nile Ruby Nile Cruise

Price Starting From : $0

5 Days Luxor/ Aswan Every Thursday
Egypt
Luxor. Aswan

Experience luxury and elegance with MS Nile Ruby and Royal Ruby, two 5-star deluxe River Nile cruise
ships. These magnificent vessels have been meticulously constructed by talented Italian engineers, adhering
to the highest standards and regulations set by the American Bureau of Shipping. Our Best Egypt Nile cruise
packages from the USA cater to discerning travelers who seek an unforgettable journey through the
enchanting landscapes of Egypt. Immerse yourself in the timeless wonders of this ancient land with our
thoughtfully curated itineraries and exceptional service. Embark on our Egypt tour packages from the USA
and let us take care of all the details, ensuring a seamless and hassle-free experience. Discover the treasures
of the Nile as you cruise along its legendary waters, exploring iconic landmarks and immersing yourself in
the rich history and culture of Egypt. Join us on our Egypt Nile Cruise Tours and witness the awe-inspiring
temples, tombs, and ancient sites that have captivated travelers for centuries. Let MS Nile Ruby and Royal
Ruby be your luxurious floating sanctuary as you uncover the mysteries of this extraordinary land.

Embark on an unforgettable journey with our Egypt Tour Packages, where luxury, comfort, and discovery
await you at every turn.

Overview
Inclusion

Your pick-up services are covered by Cairo Top Tours representative from any requested place.

Support our customer care throughout the trip.

Transportation in private nonsmoking air-conditioned vehicles.

Full board accommodation from Luxor to Aswan for 4 nights onboard the 5-star Nile Ruby Nile Cruise.

All excursions during Egypt Nile Cruise Tours are strictly private.

Entrance fees to the various sites in Luxor and Aswan and on the way at Edfu and Kom Ombo.

Professional private tour guide during your Egypt Tours Packages.

Free bottled water during the Tours in Egypt.

All service charges and taxes for your Egypt tours are included.

Shopping tours during the Excursions in Luxor and Aswan Sightseeing Tours. (upon request)

Stops for snacks upon request.

A soft drink on a local Cafe during Egypt Day Tours. ( if we have time )

Exclusion
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Any optional Egypt day tours in Luxor or Aswan or activities we did not mention in the itinerary.

Tipping is not part of the price and is up to your estimate if you think the service is worth it during your
Egypt Nile River Cruise.

Beverage during meals.

 

Itinerary

Day 1: Thursday - Embarkation - Luxor East Bank Tours

Welcome to Luxor. Our representative will meet you at Luxor airport or train station and transfer you by a
private air-conditioned vehicle to board your luxurious MS Nile Ruby Nile Cruise before lunch. Start your
Luxor east bank tours to visit the Temple of Luxor that was established during the New Kingdom by
Amenhotep III and was completed by King Ramses II. Continue to visit the Temple of Karnak, which was
the center of religion and administration during the new kingdom of ancient Egypt history, and see the great
hypostyle hall with the forest of columns and huge statues and the sacred lake in the innermost. Transfer to
the cruise ship accompanied by your certified tour guide. Enjoy your dinner and overnight aboard the boat in
Luxor.

Meals: Lunch, Dinner

Day 2: Friday - Luxor West Bank Tours

Start your 2nd day by enjoying your delightful breakfast aboard the boat with a great chance to enjoy a
captivating Hot Air Balloon ride in Luxor in the morning, your Egyptologist will guide you to one of the
most pleasant Egypt Day Tours in Luxor, enjoy the West Bank of Luxor tours by visiting the Valley of the
Kings, which is the burial area of several famous kings of ancient Egypt during the new kingdom.

You will be transferred then to visit Queen Hatshepsut's Temple at El Deir El Bahari, which is considered
among the most important mortuary temples, and the Colossi of Memnon that were built for King
Amenhotep III. Sail to Esna and your lunch will be served aboard the cruise ship before the afternoon tea and
the Captain's Welcome Cocktail Party starts. Enjoy your dinner and overnight in Esna

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner

Day 3: Saturday - Edfu and Kom Ombo Temples

You will enjoy having breakfast aboard the cruise boat after you will Sail to Edfu then start your second
Egypt Day Tours by visiting Edfu Temple which was built for the worship of God Horus who was the son of
Osiris and Isis and was among the strongest and the most significant gods of ancient Egypt according to the
ancient Egyptian religion, you will have a peaceful and relaxing lunch while enjoying the view then visit
the Temple shared by two gods Sobek and Haroeris in Kom Ombo. then you will proceed to sail Aswan
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while enjoying an oriental music show.

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner

Day 4: Sunday - Aswan Nile Cruise Tours

After having your tasty breakfast aboard the Nile Cruise in Aswan, you will start Aswan day tours to visit the
most significant accomplishment in the modern history of Egypt, the High Dam, established to the south of
Aswan between Aswan and Sudan. Then your licensed tour guide will guide you to explore the area of the
granite quarries to see the largest Unfinished Obelisk which was constructed during the reign of the
legendary Queen Hatshepsut, ruler of Egypt during the new kingdom.

Finally, we will take you by motorboat to resume our Aswan excursions to the Temple of Philae, which has
been relocated on the Agilika Island during a campaign that took place in the 60s of the 20th century to
preserve the temple from being drowned by the water of the Nile, the temple was constructed for the worship
of Goddess Isis who was the husband of the legendary God Osiris. god of the underworld. Enjoy your lunch
aboard the cruise boat and your relaxing afternoon tea. Overnight in Aswan

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner

Day 5: Monday - Disembarkation

After having breakfast aboard the cruise ship, you will disembark and be transferred by our representative to
Aswan airport or train station after you enjoyed your 5 days Luxor to Aswan Nile Cruise aboard the 5-star
Nile Ruby Nile Cruise.

Meals: Breakfast
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